From: Elizabeth Jones

To: Trisha Linebarger
Subject: FW: Public Input Form for Agencies Under Review (Public/After Publication)
Date: Friday, December 18, 2020 3:54:38 PM

From: sunset@sunset.texas.govOn Behalf OfTexas Sunset Commission

Sent: Friday, December 18, 2020 3:35:23 PM (UTC-06:00) Central Time (US & Canada)
To: Sunset Advisory Commission

Subject: Public Input Form for Agencies Under Review (Public/After Publication)

Agency: TEXAS DEPARTMENT LICENSING AND REGULATION

First Name: Miacarla

Last Name: Lozano

Title: Pastor

Organization you are affiliated with: Riverside Community Church

Email: pastormia@theriversidewaco.com

City: Waco

State: Texas

Your Comments About the Staff Report, Including Recommendations Supported or

Opposed: Hi there, my husband and i are full time pastors and hold defensive driving classes as a service to the
community here at our church. The set $25 is a perfect cost for the people in our community because it is an enough
base cost that the people of our community can afford and it helps to offset the finances of the church. We live in
walking distance to an apartment complex as well as in walking distance for lots of people. Some of the people in
our community are either poverty level or close to that and do not have access to computers or even printers, so
keeping the base cost of defensive driving at a cost that the community can afford and the small churches can still
hold classes, for those without the essential equipment to do it online and print it from their homes, and yet still be
able to pay the cost of the utilities is absolutely needed. This is not only critical but crucial to our community and
full time pastors like myself that are not mega churches, to be able to engage with the community and be of service.

Any Alternative or New Recommendations on This Agency: no

My Comment Will Be Made Public: | agree
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